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SECTION SF 30 BLOCK 14 CONTINUATION PAGE

SUMMARY OF CHANGES

The purpose of this modification is to:

A. Add the Consolidated Buy-8 Desktops, Notebooks, and Monitors CLINs 0910AA-0910AN, 0911AA-0911AQ,
0913AA- 0913AV, 0914AA- 0914AU, 0915AA- 0915AT, 0916AA- 0916AS, 0917AA-0917AB, 0918AA-0918AB

and Incorporate the Consolidated Buy-8 Specification and Pricing Spreadsheets as attached.

B. Upon acceptance of this modification, the contractor agrees to the placement of the modification on the Army
Computer Hardware, Enterprise Software and Solutions (CHESS) website.

C. Updates Part C. 4, Consolidated Buy Terms and Conditions.

D. All other terms and conditions remain unchanged.

SUPPLIES OR SERVICES AND PRICES

CLIN 0910 is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE MAX AMOUNT
QUANTITY
0910 UNDEFINED $0.00 $0.00
Small Form Factor CB-8
FFP

FOB: Destination

MAX $0.00
NET AMT

SUBCLIN 0910AA is added as follows:
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AA UNDEFINED Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AC is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AC UNDEFINED Each
Processor Upgrade
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AD is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$595.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$695.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$97.56

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AD UNDEFINED Each
Memory Upgrade 4GB
FFP

Increase required 2 GB base to stated Installed RAM
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT

0910AE

QUANTITY
UNDEFINED Each
HDD Upgrade
FFP
250GB, SATA
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AF is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$42.68

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$7.62

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AF UNDEFINED Each
USB to Serial Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-9 Female
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AG UNDEFINED Each
USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-25 Male
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AH is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AH UNDEFINED Each
Multimedia Speakers
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$11.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$23.95

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$14.48

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0910AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AJ UNDEFINED Each

Dual Port Video Card
FFP

For Dual Monitor Support; DirectX 10, WDDM 2.0, Pixel Shader Model 2.0, 2-

DVI Ports.
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AK UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AL is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$15.24

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$67.84

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AL UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AM is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AM UNDEFINED Each

Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0910AN is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0910AN UNDEFINED Each

Two Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$129.24

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$98.33

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$280.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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CLIN 0911 is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0911 UNDEFINED $0.00
Mini-Tower (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02- Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUBCLIN 0911AA is added as follows:
ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0911AA UNDEFINED Each $595.00
CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX
NET AMT

SUBCLIN 0911AB is added as follows:

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AB UNDEFINED Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AC is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AC UNDEFINED Each
Processor Upgrade
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AD is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AD UNDEFINED Each
Memory Upgrade 4 GB
FFP

Increase required 2 GB base to stated Installed RAM
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$695.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$97.56

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$42.68

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0911AE is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AE UNDEFINED Each
HDD Upgrade
FFP
250GB, SATA

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AF is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AF UNDEFINED Each
Additional HDD
FFP
250GB, SATA

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AG is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$7.62

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$58.69

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AG UNDEFINED Each

Additional Removable HDD

FFP

Removable HDD; 250 GB, SATA.
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AH is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AH UNDEFINED Each

USB to Serial Adapter

FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-9 Female.
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AJ UNDEFINED Each

USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-25 Male
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$169.24

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$11.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$23.95

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0911AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AK UNDEFINED Each
Multimedia Speakers
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AL is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AL UNDEFINED Each
Dual Port Video Card
FFP

For Dual Monitor Support; DirectX 10, WDDM 2.0, Pixel Shader model 2.0, 2-

DVI Ports.
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AM is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$14.48

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$15.24

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AM UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AN is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AN UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0911AP is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0911AP UNDEFINED Each

Two Year Extended CONUS Waranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$67.84

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$129.24

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$98.33

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0911AQ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0911AQ UNDEFINED Each $280.00
Two Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
CLIN 0912 is added as follows:
ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0912 UNDEFINED $0.00
All-In-One-Desktop (CB-8)
FFP
POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination
MAX
NET AMT

SUBCLIN 0912AA is added as follows:

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AA UNDEFINED Each
CONUS - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AC is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AC UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AD is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AD UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AE UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AF is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AF UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0912AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AG UNDEFINED Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AH is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AH UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912A) UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0912AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AK UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AL is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AL UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AM is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AM UNDEFINED Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0912AN is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0912AN UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

CLIN 0913 is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913 UNDEFINED
Mainstream Notebook (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0913AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AA UNDEFINED Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AC is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AC UNDEFINED Each
Processor Upgrade
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$919.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,019.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$54.04

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0913AD is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AD UNDEFINED Each
Memory Upgrade 4 GB
FFP

Increase required 2 GB base to stated Installed RAM
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AE UNDEFINED Each
HDD Upgrade
FFP
250GB, SATA

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AF is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$84.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$84.91

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AF UNDEFINED Each

Additional HDD
FFP

120GB, SATA
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AG UNDEFINED Each

External HDD

FFP

External HDD; 160 GB, USB 2.0
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AH is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AH UNDEFINED Each

Wireless Card

FFP

802.11a, 802.11i,WPA2 Enterprise Certified
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$115.01

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$11.58

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0913AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AJ UNDEFINED Each
USB to Serial Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-9 Female
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AK UNDEFINED Each
USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-25 Male
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AL is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$11.01

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$23.95

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AL UNDEFINED Each
Docking Station
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AM is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AM UNDEFINED Each
Port Replicator
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AN is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AN UNDEFINED Each
Carrying Case
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AP is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$153.61

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$99.58

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$37.82

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0913AP UNDEFINED Each $145.90
Replacement Battery
FFP

An additional battery for swap out or to supplement primary battery.
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUBCLIN 0913AQ is added as follows:
ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0913AQ UNDEFINED Each UNDEFINED
External Battery - NO BID
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX
NET AMT
SUBCLIN 0913AR is added as follows:
ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0913AR UNDEFINED Each $64.50
Express Card to PCMCIA Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0913AS is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AS UNDEFINED Each
One Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 year Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AT is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AT UNDEFINED Each
One Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 year Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AU is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$115.01

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$317.61

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AU UNDEFINED Each

Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0913AYV is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0913AV UNDEFINED Each

Two Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

CLIN 0914 is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914 UNDEFINED
Specialty Notebook (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$192.21

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$558.80

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00
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SUBCLIN 0914AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AA UNDEFINED  Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AC is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$897.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$997.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AC UNDEFINED Each
Memory Upgrade 4GB
FFP

Increase required 2 GB base to stated Installed RAM
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AD is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AD UNDEFINED Each

HDD Upgrade
FFP

250GB, SATA
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AE UNDEFINED Each

Additional HDD
FFP

120GB

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$84.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$84.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$115.01

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0914AF is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AF UNDEFINED Each
External HDD
FFP

External HDD; 160 GB, USB 2.0.
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AG UNDEFINED Each
Wireless Card
FFP

802.11a, 802.11i, WPA2 Enterprise Certified
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AH is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$11.58

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AH UNDEFINED Each
USB to Serial Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-9 Female
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AJ UNDEFINED Each
USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-25 Male
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AK UNDEFINED Each
Docking Station
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$11.91

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$23.95

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$153.61

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0914AL is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AL UNDEFINED Each
Port Replicator
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AM is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AM UNDEFINED Each
Carrying Case
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AN is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$99.58

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$37.82

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0914AN UNDEFINED Each $145.90
Replacement Battery
FFP

An additional battery for swap out or to supplement primary battery.
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUBCLIN 0914AP is added as follows:
ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0914AP UNDEFINED Each UNDEFINED
External Battery - NO BID
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX
NET AMT
SUBCLIN 0914AQ is added as follows:
ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0914AQ UNDEFINED Each $64.50
Express Card to PCMCIA Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0914AR is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AR UNDEFINED Each
One Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AS is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0914AS UNDEFINED Each
One Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 year Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AT is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$115.01

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$317.61

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES

0914AT

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty

FFP
Total 5 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0914AU is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES

0914AU

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

Two Year Extended OCONUS Warranty

FFP
Total 5 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

CLIN 0915 is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES

0915

Ruggedized/Semi-Ruggedized Notebook CB-8

FFP
POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

$192.21

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$558.80

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0915AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AA UNDEFINED  Each
CONUS - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AC is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AC UNDEFINED Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AD is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AD UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AE UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AF is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AF UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AG UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AH is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AH UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0915AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AJ UNDEFINED Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AK UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AL is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AL UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0915AM is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AM UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AN is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AN UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AP is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AP UNDEFINED Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AQ is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AQ UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AR is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AR UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AS is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AS UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0915AT is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0915AT UNDEFINED  Each
NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

CLIN 0916 is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916 UNDEFINED
Lightweight Notebook (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02- Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0916AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AA UNDEFINED  Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AC is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$1,579.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,679.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AC UNDEFINED Each
Memory Upgrade - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AD is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AD UNDEFINED Each
HDD Upgrade - NO BID
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AE is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AE UNDEFINED Each
Additional Removable HDD or External USB
FFP

160 GB, USB 2.0
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0916AF is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AF UNDEFINED Each
Wireless Card
FFP

802.11a, 802.11i, WPA2 Enterprise Certified
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AG is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AG UNDEFINED Each
USB to Serial Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-9 Female
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AH is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$11.58

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$11.91

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AH UNDEFINED Each
USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP

USB Ver 2.0, DB-25 Male
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AJ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AJ UNDEFINED Each
Docking Station
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AK is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AK UNDEFINED Each
Port Replicator
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$23.95

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$153.61

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$99.58

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0916AL is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AL UNDEFINED Each
Carrying Case
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AM is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AM UNDEFINED Each
Replacement Battery
FFP

UNIT PRICE

$22.39

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$153.61

An additional battery for swap out or to supplement primary battery.

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AN is added as follows:

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AN UNDEFINED Each

Express Card ro PCMCIA Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AP is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AP UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AQ is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AQ UNDEFINED Each

One Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 4 years Warranty

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$64.50

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$115.01

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$317.61

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

SUBCLIN 0916AR is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AR UNDEFINED Each
Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0916AS is added as follows:

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0916AS UNDEFINED Each
Two Year Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP

Total 5 years Warranty
FOB: Destination

CLIN 0917 is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$192.21

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$558.80

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0917 UNDEFINED Each
19" LCD Displays (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0917AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0917AA UNDEFINED  Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0917AB is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0917AB UNDEFINED  Each
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$128.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$148.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

CLIN 0918 is added as follows:

ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0918 UNDEFINED
22" LCD Displays (CB-8)
FFP

POP (Feb 02 - Apr 17)
FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0918AA is added as follows:

ITEMNO  SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
0918AA UNDEFINED  Each
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUBCLIN 0918AB is added as follows:

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

ITEMNO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0918AB UNDEFINED Each $185.00
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
DELIVERIES AND PERFORMANCE
The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to CLIN 0910:
DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AA:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AB:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AC:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AD:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

MAX AMOUNT
$0.00
$0.00

uIC
uic
uIC
uic
uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AE:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AF:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AG:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AH:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AJ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AK:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AL.:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic

uIC

uIC

uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AM:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0910AN:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to CLIN 0911:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AA:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AB:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AC:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AD:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic

uIC

uIC

uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AE:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AF:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AG:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AH:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AJ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AK:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AL:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic

uIC

uIC

uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AM:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AN:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AP:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0911AQ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to CLIN 0912:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AA:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AB:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic

uIC

uIC

uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AC:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AD:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AE:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AF:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AG:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AH:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AJ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic
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uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AK:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AL.:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AM:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0912AN:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to CLIN 0913:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AA:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AB:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic
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uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AC:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AD:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AE:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AF:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AG:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AH:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AJ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS

uic
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uic

uIC

uIC

uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AK:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AL.:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AM:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AN:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AP:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AQ:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AR:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
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uIC



W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AS:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AT:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AU:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0913AV:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to CLIN 0914:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AA:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AB:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
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W91QUZ-06-D-0002

POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AC:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AD:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AE:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AF:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AG:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Schedule item has been added to SUBCLIN 0914AH:

DELIVERY DATE QUANTITY SHIP TO ADDRESS
POP 02-FEB-2009 TO N/A N/A
17-APR-2009 FOB: Destination

The following Delivery Sc